

Wayne County Water & Sewer Authority

Commonly Used Materials - Bid opening Thursday, August 20, 2020 at 11 a.m.							
Awarded on the basis of total of unit prices in each category							
	VENDOR	VENDOR	VENDOR	VENDOR	VENDOR	VENDOR	VENDOR
Categories	Ferguson Enterprises	Ti-Sales	F. W. Webb	Blair Supply	EJ Prescott	Core and Main	T Mina Supply
Total Tapping Saddles	525.16	1,016.42	563.56	523.60	CATEGORY INCOMPLETE	500.75	520.00
Total Curb Boxes and Parts	125.01	NO BID	88.29	147.80	CATEGORY INCOMPLETE	85.75	NO BID
Total Water Service Tubing Copper Tube Size (CTS)	2.22	NO BID	2.23	2.14	2.14	2.42	2.31
Total Water Main Repair Bands	5,041.00	NO BID	5,786.66	3,610.82	CATEGORY INCOMPLETE	3,372.00	5,038.00
Total Water Main Repair Couplings	2,813.15	NO BID	2,621.80	2,643.31	CATEGORY INCOMPLETE	2,637.00	NO BID
Total Valve Boxes and Parts	523.60	NO BID	622.99	578.00	538.02	590.00	508.00
Total Hydrants	10,733.00	7,219.62	NO BID	9,621.00	NO BID	9,498.00	NO BID
Total Meter Setting Brass	NO BID	1,012.73	603.53	914.00	677.92	888.25	NO BID
Total Water Service Brass	NO BID	1,259.21	1,381.33	1,237.18	CATEGORY INCOMPLETE	1,176.80	1,357.65
Total C-509 Valves	3,605.80	2,739.60	3,428.35	3,510.11	NO BID	3,440.00	3,805.00
Total C-515 Valves	3,605.80	2,739.60	3,428.35	3,516.00	3,488.18	3,440.00	NO BID
Total Sewer Parts	1,269.01	NO BID	1,371.43	1,442.93	CATEGORY INCOMPLETE	1,385.45	1,632.00
THIS IS ONLY A TABULATION AND DOES NOT IMPLY ACCEPTANCE OF BIDS							