

**2018 Arcadia WD 17 Materials**  
**1 p.m. Tuesday, October 16, 2018**  
**Bid Tabulation**

ITEM DESCRIPTION	Blair Supply	EJ Prescott	Core & Main	Martisco Corp	FW Webb Co	Ti-Sales
8" DR 18 PVC Pipe 16,500 foot Unit Price	\$ 6.88	\$ 6.69	\$ 6.58	\$ 6.77	\$ 6.86	No Bid
Manufacturer USIS cert provided Y/N	Ipex N/A	JM Eagle N/A	JM Eagle N/A	Ipex N/A	Ipex N/A	
6" Mechanical Gasket Pack with 4-1/2" T-Bolts 90 each Unit Price	\$ 10.95	\$ 17.85	\$ 15.00	\$ 13.35	No Bid	\$ 13.73
	Birmingham Y	Birmingham Y	Birmingham Y	Birmingham Y		Napac N
8" Mechanical Gasket Pack with 4" T-Bolts 190 each Unit Price	\$ 11.10	\$ 15.95	\$ 14.00	\$ 12.65	No Bid	\$ 15.27
	Birmingham Y	Birmingham Y	Birmingham Y	Birmingham Y		Napac N
8" Mechanical Gasket Pack with 6" T-Bolts 20 each Unit Price	\$ 15.00	\$ 19.95	\$ 21.00	\$ 15.45	No Bid	\$ 27.69
	Birmingham Y	Birmingham Y	Birmingham Y	Birmingham Y		Napac N
8" MJ Restraints for PVC 190 each Unit Price	\$ 36.00	\$ 35.50	\$ 33.99	\$ 36.25	No Bid	\$ 37.98
	Ford Y	Ford Y	Ford Y	Ford Y		No cut sheet
8" x 6" x 8" Anchor Tee 29 each Unit Price	\$ 189.12	\$ 193.00	\$ 182.12	\$ 186.65	No Bid	\$ 123.61
	Tyler Union Y	Tyler Union Y	Star Y	Sar Y		Napac
6" x 3 ft Anchor Pipe 25 each Unit Price	\$ 145.51	\$ 551.50	\$ 132.00	\$ 132.00	No Bid	\$ 172.83
	Clearwater Y	Tyler Union Y	Clearwater Y	Clearwater Y		No cut sheet
6" x 2 ft Anchor Pipe 3 each Unit Price	\$ 155.94	\$ 156.50	\$ 108.00	\$ 110.45	No Bid	\$ 141.55
	Clearwater Y	Tyler Union Y	Clearwater Y	Clearwaer Y		No cut sheet
6" x 1 ft Anchor Pipe 2 each Unit Price	\$ 106.46	\$ 108.50	\$ 86.00	\$ 88.85	No Bid	\$ 115.91
	Clearwater Y	Tyler Union Y	Clearwater Y	Clearwater Y		No cut sheet
6" Gate Valve MJ x MJ 29 each Unit Price	\$ 576.25	\$ 520.00	\$ 576.00	\$ 583.45	No Bid	\$ 588.36
	Kennedy Y	America Flow Cnt. Y	Mueller Y	Kennedy Y		AVK N
8" Gate Valve MJ x MJ 22 each Unit Price	\$ 917.82	\$ 827.50	\$ 917.00	\$ 929.25	No Bid	\$ 926.71
	Kennedy Y	America Flow Cnt. Y	Mueller Y	Kennedy Y		AVK N
2-piece Valve Box with Lid 51 each Unit Price	\$ 144.45	\$ 157.50	\$ 129.99	\$ 132.35	No Bid	\$ 119.31
	Tyler Union Y	East Jordan N	Bingham Taylor Y	Bingham Taylor Y		Bibby Ste-Croix N
Hydrant Unit, from MJ Inlet to Bonnet 29 each Unit Price	\$ 2,243.07	No Bid	\$ 2,232.00	\$ 2,255.00	No Bid	\$ 2,034.31
	Kennedy Y		Mueller Y	Kennedy Y		AVK N
8" MJ x MJ Solid Sleeve 19 each Unit Price	\$ 103.95	\$ 106.00	\$ 100.11	\$ 103.00	No Bid	\$ 97.98
	Tyler Union Y	Tyler Union Y	Star Y	Star Y		Napac N

ITEM DESCRIPTION			Blair Supply	EJ Prescott	Core & Main	Martisco Corp	FW Webb Co	Ti-Sales	
8" MJ x 8" MJ x 8" MJ Tee	2	each	Unit Price	\$ 196.01	\$ 200.00	\$ 188.75	\$ 194.40	No Bid	\$ 144.22
				Tyler Union Y	Tyler Union Y	Star Y	Star Y		Napac N
1" SS Tapping Saddle for 8" PVC	15	each	Unit Price	\$ 79.00	No Bid	\$ 79.99	\$ 76.35	No Bid	\$ 72.55
				Smith Blair Y		Smith Blair Y	Smith Blair Y		Smith Blair N
1" Corporation Stop - Lead Free Brass	15	each	Unit Price	\$ 40.00	\$ 36.25	\$ 41.00	\$ 44.65	No Bid	\$ 46.47
				Ford Y	AY McDonald Y	Ford Y	Mueller Y		Ford N
1" Curb Stop - Lead Free Brass	15	each	Unit Price	\$ 79.50	\$ 75.75	\$ 83.00	\$ 101.35	No Bid	\$ 85.24
				Ford Y	AY McDonald Y	Ford Y	Mueller Y		Ford N
1" SS Insert	30	each	Unit Price	\$ 1.20	No Bid	\$ 1.50	\$ 1.50	No Bid	\$ 1.42
				Ford Y		Ford Y	Mueller Y		No cut sheet
1" Polyethylene CTS 200 psi Water Service Tubing	200	feet	Unit Price	\$ 0.35	\$ 0.35	\$ 0.34	\$ 0.33	\$ 0.38	\$ 0.38
				Endot N/A	ADS N/A	ADS N/A	ADS N/A	ADS N/A	no cut sheet
8" 22-1/2 degree MJ Bend	7	each	Unit Price	\$ 103.95	\$ 106.00	\$ 100.11	\$ 103.00	No Bid	\$ 76.92
				Tyler Union Y	Tyler Union Y	Star Y	Star Y		Napac N
8" 11-1/4 degree MJ Bend	4	each	Unit Price	\$ 95.19	\$ 97.00	\$ 91.66	\$ 94.40	No Bid	\$ 70.05
				Tyler Union Y	Tyler Union Y	Star Y	Star Y		Napac N
8" 45 degree MJ Bend	14	each	Unit Price	\$ 106.46	\$ 109.00	\$ 102.52	\$ 105.55	No Bid	\$ 78.75
				Tyler Union Y	Tyler Union Y	Star Y	Star Y		Napac N
8" 90 degree MJ Bend	1	each	Unit Price	\$ 133.38	\$ 156.50	\$ 128.45	\$ 132.25	No Bid	\$ 96.60
				Tyler Union Y	Tyler Union Y	Star Y	Star Y		Napac N
Underground Marking Tape	16,500	feet	Unit Price	\$ 0.40000	\$ 0.4500	\$ 0.3500	\$ 0.4100	\$ 0.5000	\$ 0.4300
				Pro Line N/A	Sigma N/A	Omega N/A	Pro Line N/A	Pro Line N/A	no cut sheet