

2020 Brown Wadsworth WD Wolcott Project
Tuesday February 18, 2020 at 1 p.m.
Bid Tabulation

ITEM DESCRIPTION				Ti-Sales	T.Mina	EJP Inc	Blair Supply	Core & Main	FW Webb
6" Gate Valve MJ x MJ	40	each	Unit Price	\$ 514.68	\$ 578.90	\$ 600.00	\$ 573.00	\$ 569.00	\$ 572.90
8" Gate Valve MJ x MJ	24	each	Unit Price	\$ 819.01	\$ 922.06	\$ 955.00	\$ 912.00	\$ 906.00	\$ 912.54
2-piece Valve Box with Lid	64	each	Unit Price	NO BID	\$ 130.00	NO BID	\$ 152.00	\$ 127.50	\$ 129.54
Light Duty Single Terminal Magnetized Tracer Box	8	each	Unit Price	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 31.80	\$ 35.00	\$ 48.95
8" 11-1/4 degree MJ bend	6	each	Unit Price	NO BID	\$ 102.26	\$ 101.50	\$ 97.20	\$ 94.00	\$ 103.15
8" 22-1/2 degree MJ bend	6	each	Unit Price	NO BID	\$ 111.85	\$ 111.00	\$ 106.31	\$ 103.00	\$ 112.80
8" 45 degree MJ Bend	6	each	Unit Price	NO BID	\$ 114.40	\$ 113.00	\$ 108.74	\$ 105.00	\$ 115.35
8" MJ Plug	5	each	Unit Price	NO BID	\$ 83.72	\$ 83.00	\$ 79.58	\$ 77.00	\$ 85.26
8" MJ x 8" MJ x 8" Swivel Tee	3	each	Unit Price	NO BID	\$ 292.72	\$ 290.00	\$ 278.24	\$ 269.00	\$ 294.85
8" PVC Bell-Spigot Joint Restraint	26	each	Unit Price	NO BID	\$ 164.00	\$ 71.00	\$ 55.99	\$ 56.00	\$ 59.65
8" HDPE to MJ Adapter	4	each	Unit Price	NO BID	\$ 96.00	NO BID	\$ 97.33	\$ 87.00	\$ 99.63
8" HDPE / MJ Adapter Kit	4	each	Unit Price	NO BID	\$ 31.00	NO BID	\$ 76.10	\$ 28.00	\$ 33.20
8" MJ Restraints for PVC	200	each	Unit Price	\$ 39.76	\$ 37.90	\$ 35.75	\$ 35.82	\$ 34.95	\$ 38.16
6" Mechanical Gasket Pack with 4-1/2" T-Bolts	120	each	Unit Price	\$ 28.09	\$ 45.00	\$ 18.75	\$ 14.61	\$ 15.45	\$ 15.83
ALTERNATE: 6" Mechanical Gasket Pack with Fluorocarbon-coated 4-1/2" T-Bolts	120	each	Unit Price	\$ 41.16	\$ 88.33	\$ 15.50	\$ 18.65	\$ 19.05	\$ 19.40
8" Mechanical Gasket Pack with 4" T-Bolts	200	each	Unit Price	\$ 30.06	\$ 46.67	\$ 13.25	\$ 14.04	\$ 13.24	\$ 13.32
ALTERNATE: 8" Mechanical Gasket Pack with Fluorocarbon-coated 4" T-Bolts	200	each	Unit Price	\$ 41.97	\$ 90.00	\$ 17.00	\$ 19.10	\$ 17.20	\$ 17.35
8" Mechanical Gasket Pack with 6" T-Bolts	10	each	Unit Price	\$ 33.53	\$ 60.00	\$ 18.25	\$ 19.10	\$ 18.55	\$ 19.05
ALTERNATE: 8" Mechanical Gasket Pack with Fluorocarbon-coated 6" T-Bolts	10	each	Unit Price	\$ 58.96	\$ 125.00	\$ 21.00	\$ 25.84	\$ 21.10	\$ 21.73

Wayne County Water & Sewer Authority

ITEM DESCRIPTION				Ti-Sales	T.Mina	EJP Inc	Blair Supply	Core & Main	FW Webb
Hydrant Unit, from MJ Inlet to Bonnet - 5-1/2 ft bury	40	each	Unit Price	\$ 1,874.47	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 2,279.50	\$ 2,261.00	NO BID
ALTERNATE ITEM: Hydrant Unit, from MJ Inlet to Bonnet - 5 foot bury	40	each	Unit Price	\$ 1,833.78	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 2,230.00	\$ 2,212.00	NO BID
8" x 6" x 8" Anchor Tee	40	each	Unit Price	NO BID	\$ 203.25	\$ 201.00	\$ 193.19	\$ 186.00	\$ 203.05
6" x 3 ft Anchor Pipe	40	each	Unit Price	NO BID	\$ 476.81	\$ 510.00	\$ 206.00	\$ 147.00	\$ 180.55
6" x 2 ft Anchor Pipe	3	each	Unit Price	NO BID	\$ 164.90	\$ 165.75	\$ 159.17	\$ 121.00	\$ 157.15
6" x 1 ft Anchor Pipe	3	each	Unit Price	NO BID	\$ 111.85	\$ 113.25	\$ 106.31	\$ 99.00	\$ 128.65
1" SS Tapping Saddle for 8" PVC	30	each	Unit Price	\$ 88.63	\$ 66.50	NO BID	\$ 62.00	\$ 84.95	\$ 81.05
1" Corporation Stop - Lead Free Brass	30	each	Unit Price	\$ 68.27	\$ 44.18	\$ 43.75	\$ 44.44	\$ 44.00	\$ 47.95
1" Curb Stop - Lead Free Brass	30	each	Unit Price	\$ 106.84	\$ 88.91	\$ 88.00	\$ 87.00	\$ 86.28	\$ 96.15
1" Polyethylene CTS 200 psi Water Service Tubing	300	feet	Unit Price	NO BID	\$ 0.30	\$ 0.36	\$ 0.39	\$ 0.30	\$ 0.37
1" SS Insert	60	each	Unit Price	\$ 1.61	\$ 2.00	\$ 1.40	\$ 1.33	\$ 1.50	\$ 1.63
8" HDPE DIPS DR-11 Blue Stripe Water Main Pipe	200	feet	Unit Price	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 14.53	\$ 9.95	\$ 15.15
Underground Warning Tape -1,000 ft Roll	22	each	Unit Price	NO BID	\$ 75.000	\$ 48.000	\$ 42.00	\$ 35.00	\$ 43.840