

Wayne County Water & Sewer Authority

Commonly Used Materials - Bid opening Tuesday, August 21, 2018, 11:00 am						
Awarded on the basis of total of unit prices in each category						
Categories	T Mina - did not register. Bid not opened	F W Webb	TI-SALES	Blair Supply	Core & Main	E J P
Total Tapping Saddles	-	549.51	556.02	522.81	499.77	NO BID
Total Curb Boxes and Parts	-	50.92	75.83	68.30	58.32	61.25
Total Water Service Tubing Copper Tube Size (CTS)	-	2.28	2.96	2.31	2.27	NO BID
Total Water Main Repair Bands	-	5,619.36	5,331.57	3,458.12	3,543.92	NO BID
Total Water Main Repair Couplings	-	2,715.82	2,699.35	2,513.00	2,526.44	NO BID
Total Hydrants	-	NO BID	3,627.14	4,532.00	4,479.10	NO BID
Total Valve Boxes and Parts	-	394.07	417.77	435.20	337.76	NO BID
Total Meter Setting Brass	-	331.16	556.48	347.00	412.35	311.00
Total Water Service Brass	-	1,286.78	1,086.74	998.58	1,000.40	1,244.55
Total C-509 Valves	-	3,271.71	4,366.70	3,211.13	3,255.00	NO BID
Total C-515 Valves	-	3,271.71	2,922.22	3,211.13	3,255.00	2,979.50
Total Sewer Parts	-	1,128.02	NO BID	1,274.02	1,171.43	NO BID