

**Huron Water District #8**  
**Thursday, April 22, 2021 2:00 p.m.**  
**Bid Tabulation**

ITEM DESCRIPTION			T Mina	F W Webb	TI-Sales	Ferguson	Vari-Tech	Blair	Core & Main	
12" Rubbers and 4" Fluorocarbon-coated T-Bolts	90	each	Unit Price	\$ 31.73	\$ 29.47	NO BID	\$ 37.40	NO BID	\$ 28.62	\$ 29.49
12" Rubbers and 6" Fluorocarbon-coated T-Bolts	10	each	Unit Price	\$ 35.99	\$ 33.45	NO BID	\$ 46.50	NO BID	\$ 43.50	\$ 33.49
8" Rubbers and 4" Fluorocarbon-coated T-Bolts	48	each	Unit Price	\$ 21.67	\$ 20.17	NO BID	\$ 26.10	NO BID	\$ 20.61	\$ 20.19
8" Rubbers and 4-1/2" Fluorocarbon-coated T-Bolts	1	each	Unit Price	\$ 23.52	\$ 21.88	NO BID	\$ 29.05	NO BID	\$ 21.29	\$ 21.89
8" Rubbers and 6" Fluorocarbon-coated T-Bolts	14	each	Unit Price	\$ 25.78	\$ 23.90	NO BID	\$ 34.25	NO BID	\$ 32.63	\$ 23.94
6" Rubbers and 4-1/2" Fluorocarbon-coated T-Bolts	80	each	Unit Price	\$ 22.10	\$ 21.88	NO BID	\$ 26.85	NO BID	\$ 19.75	\$ 21.59
12" PVC MJ Restraints "Megalug" style	85	each	Unit Price	\$ 73.01	\$ 69.05	NO BID	\$ 76.35	NO BID	\$ 69.01	\$ 67.30
8" PVC MJ Restraints "Megalug" style	48	each	Unit Price	\$ 36.74	\$ 34.73	NO BID	\$ 38.40	NO BID	\$ 36.38	\$ 35.50
Hydrant Unit, from MJ Inlet to Bonnet - 5-1/2 Foot Bury	19	each	Unit Price	NO BID	\$ 2,493.40	\$ 2,015.66	\$ 2,491.00	NO BID	\$ 2,502.00	\$ 2,493.00
Hydrant Unit, from MJ Inlet to Bonnet - 5 Foot Bury	8	each	Unit Price	NO BID	\$ 2,439.15	\$ 1,971.90	\$ 2,437.00	NO BID	\$ 2,448.00	\$ 2,439.00
12"x 6"x 12" Anchor Tee	20	each	Unit Price	\$ 391.50	\$ 377.45	NO BID	\$ 399.10	NO BID	\$ 395.07	\$ 390.95
8"x 6"x 8" Anchor Tee	8	each	Unit Price	\$ 215.50	\$ 209.70	NO BID	\$ 219.70	NO BID	\$ 217.48	\$ 209.74
6" x 3 ft Anchor pipe	27	each	Unit Price	\$ 573.00	\$ 175.15	NO BID	\$ 287.55	NO BID	\$ 201.48	\$ 161.95
6" MJ x MJ Gate Valve	27	each	Unit Price	\$ 648.00	\$ 645.65	\$ 553.12	\$ 638.00	NO BID	\$ 651.00	\$ 638.00
8" MJ x MJ Gate Valve	6	each	Unit Price	\$ 1,032.00	\$ 1,026.49	\$ 880.17	\$ 1,016.00	NO BID	\$ 1,035.00	\$ 1,017.00
12" MJ x MJ Gate Valve	13	each	Unit Price	\$ 2,036.00	\$ 2,020.33	\$ 1,736.29	\$ 2,006.00	NO BID	\$ 2,038.00	\$ 2,007.00
2-piece screw type Valve Box with Lid, 38"-60" range	46	each	Unit Price	\$ 150.00	\$ 148.13	NO BID	\$ 170.35	NO BID	\$ 163.43	\$ 149.49
Light Duty Single Terminal Magnetized Tracer Box	10	each	Unit Price	NO BID	\$ 35.78	NO BID	\$ 23.50	NO BID	\$ 26.49	\$ 39.00
8" HDPE to MJ Adapter w/SS Stiffener	4	each	Unit Price	\$ 95.00	\$ 126.35	NO BID	\$ 89.25	\$ 96.48	\$ 93.99	\$ 82.50
8" Gland, no accessories	4	each	Unit Price	\$ 13.15	\$ 13.85	NO BID	\$ 13.00	\$ 46.56	\$ 14.76	\$ 12.75
12" MJ Solid Sleeve	10	each	Unit Price	\$ 239.00	\$ 231.60	NO BID	\$ 243.75	NO BID	\$ 241.29	\$ 232.75
8" MJ Solid Sleeve	14	each	Unit Price	\$ 118.50	\$ 116.10	NO BID	\$ 120.90	NO BID	\$ 119.68	\$ 115.49
12" PVC Bell-Spigot Joint Restraint	20	each	Unit Price	\$ 131.41	\$ 120.60	NO BID	\$ 120.25	NO BID	\$ 103.52	\$ 143.90

ITEM DESCRIPTION				T Mina	F W Webb	TI-Sales	Ferguson	Vari-Tech	Blair	Core & Main
8" PVC Bell-Spigot Joint Restraint	28	each	Unit Price	\$ 74.10	\$ 69.63	NO BID	\$ 63.00	NO BID	\$ 54.27	\$ 81.05
1" Stainless Steel Tapping Saddle for 12" PVC	12	each	Unit Price	\$ 90.00	\$ 251.15	NO BID	\$ 82.10	NO BID	\$ 111.77	\$ 107.50
1" Stainless Steel Tapping Saddle for 8" PVC	5	each	Unit Price	\$ 73.00	\$ 231.60	NO BID	\$ 80.10	NO BID	\$ 104.96	\$ 101.00
1" Corporation Stop	17	each	Unit Price	\$ 48.00	\$ 49.00	\$ 58.70	\$ 56.90	NO BID	\$ 48.00	\$ 48.92
1" Curb Stop	17	each	Unit Price	\$ 77.00	\$ 98.50	\$ 118.18	\$ 127.25	NO BID	\$ 97.00	\$ 95.98
1" Stainless Steel Insert	34	each	Unit Price	\$ 1.50	\$ 1.95	\$ 2.09	\$ 2.40	NO BID	\$ 1.70	\$ 1.59
1" PE CTS 200 psi Water Service Tubing -100 foot coils	2	each	Unit Price	\$ 35.00	\$ 39.00	NO BID	\$ 45.00	\$ 72.00	\$ 41.00	\$ 47.00
12" MJ 22-1/2 Degree Bend	2	each	Unit Price	\$ 257.00	\$ 248.85	NO BID	\$ 261.95	NO BID	\$ 259.30	\$ 249.95
12" MJ Plug	1	each	Unit Price	\$ 136.50	\$ 134.45	NO BID	\$ 139.10	NO BID	\$ 137.70	\$ 132.75
12" x 8"x 12" Swivel Tee	1	each	Unit Price	\$ 440.50	\$ 430.15	NO BID	\$ 449.15	NO BID	\$ 444.61	\$ 428.60
12" x 8" x 12" x 8" Cross	1	each	Unit Price	\$ 437.50	\$ 424.15	NO BID	\$ 445.90	NO BID	\$ 441.40	\$ 425.50
8" MJ 22 1/2 Degree Bend	1	each	Unit Price	\$ 118.50	\$ 116.23	NO BID	\$ 120.90	NO BID	\$ 119.48	\$ 115.50
8" MJ Plug	1	each	Unit Price	\$ 88.50	\$ 86.70	NO BID	\$ 90.35	NO BID	\$ 89.44	\$ 86.25
8" MJ Cap	1	each	Unit Price	\$ 65.00	\$ 64.29	NO BID	\$ 66.30	NO BID	\$ 65.63	\$ 63.40
8" HDPE DIPS DR11 Blue Stripe Water Main Pipe	280	feet	Unit Price	\$ 13.50	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 14.67	\$ 14.52	\$ 11.88	\$ 9.10
Underground Warning Tape - 1,000 ft Roll	14	each	Unit Price	\$ 46.00	\$ 40.85	NO BID	\$ 57.00	NO BID	\$ 43.00	\$ 35.00