

Regional Water Tank Project 2021 Water Main Materials Bid
Thursday, April 22, 2021 1:00 p.m.
Bid Tabulation

ITEM DESCRIPTION			T Mina	F W Webb	TI-Sales	Carbyne Construction	Ferguson	Vari-Tech	Blair Supply	Core & Main
16" Rubbers and 6" Fluorocarbon-coated T-Bolts	4 each	Unit Price	\$ 52.62	\$ 48.90	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 73.35	NO BID	\$ 68.96	\$ 48.39
16" Rubbers and 4" Fluorocarbon-coated T-Bolts	26 each	Unit Price	\$ 46.57	\$ 43.24	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 64.35	NO BID	\$ 45.98	\$ 43.25
12" Rubbers and 4" Fluorocarbon-coated T-Bolts	300 each	Unit Price	\$ 31.73	\$ 29.47	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 37.40	NO BID	\$ 28.62	\$ 29.49
12" Rubbers and 6" Fluorocarbon-coated T-Bolts	70 each	Unit Price	\$ 35.99	\$ 33.45	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 46.50	NO BID	\$ 43.50	\$ 33.49
8" Rubbers and 4" Fluorocarbon-coated T-Bolts	40 each	Unit Price	\$ 21.67	\$ 20.17	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 26.14	NO BID	\$ 20.61	\$ 20.19
8" Rubbers and 4-1/2" Fluorocarbon-coated T-Bolts	2 each	Unit Price	\$ 23.52	\$ 21.88	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 29.05	NO BID	\$ 21.29	\$ 21.89
8" Rubbers and 6" Fluocarbon-coated T-Bolts	2 each	Unit Price	\$ 25.78	\$ 23.90	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 34.25	NO BID	\$ 32.63	\$ 23.94
6" Rubbers and 4-1/2" Fluorocarbon-coated T-Bolts	120 each	Unit Price	\$ 22.10	\$ 21.60	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 26.85	NO BID	\$ 19.75	\$ 21.59
16" PVC MJ Restraints "Megalug" style	26 each	Unit Price	\$ 178.64	\$ 163.45	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 163.35	NO BID	\$ 170.16	\$ 167.49
12" PVC MJ Restraints "Megalug" style	300 each	Unit Price	\$ 73.01	\$ 69.05	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 76.35	NO BID	\$ 69.01	\$ 67.30
8" PVC MJ Restraints "Megalug" style	35 each	Unit Price	\$ 36.74	\$ 34.73	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 38.40	NO BID	\$ 36.38	\$ 35.50
Hydrant Unit, from MJ Inlet to Bonnet - 5-1/2 Foot Bury	36 each	Unit Price	NO BID	\$ 2,493.40	\$ 1,965.27	NO BID	\$ 2,491.00	NO BID	\$ 2,502.00	\$ 2,493.00
Hydrant Unit, from MJ Inlet to Bonnet - 6 Foot Bury	3 each	Unit Price	NO BID	\$ 2,548.40	\$ 2,007.92	NO BID	\$ 2,545.00	NO BID	\$ 2,555.00	\$ 2,587.00
Hydrant Unit, from MJ Inlet to Bonnet - 6 - 1/2 Foot Bury	3 each	Unit Price	NO BID	\$ 2,605.00	\$ 2,050.58	NO BID	\$ 2,600.00	NO BID	\$ 2,608.00	\$ 2,602.00
Hydrant Unit, from MJ Inlet to Bonnet - 7 Foot Bury	1 each	Unit Price	NO BID	\$ 2,658.15	\$ 2,093.24	NO BID	\$ 2,653.00	NO BID	\$ 2,685.00	\$ 2,695.00
12"x 6"x 12" Anchor Tee	40 each	Unit Price	\$ 391.57	\$ 377.45	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 399.10	NO BID	\$ 390.00	\$ 380.95
6" x 3 ft Anchor pipe	40 each	Unit Price	\$ 573.06	\$ 175.15	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 287.55	NO BID	\$ 201.48	\$ 161.95
6" MJ x MJ Gate Valve	40 each	Unit Price	\$ 648.00	\$ 645.65	\$ 545.09	\$ 600.00	\$ 638.00	NO BID	\$ 651.00	\$ 638.00
8" MJ x MJ Gate Valve	2 each	Unit Price	\$ 1,032.00	\$ 1,026.49	\$ 867.41	\$ 850.00	\$ 1,016.00	NO BID	\$ 1,035.00	\$ 1,017.00
12" MJ x MJ Gate Valve	33 each	Unit Price	\$ 2,036.00	\$ 2,020.33	\$ 1,711.12	\$ 1,700.00	\$ 2,006.00	NO BID	\$ 2,038.00	\$ 2,007.00
2-piece screw type Valve Box with Lid, 38"-60" range	75 each	Unit Price	\$ 150.00	\$ 148.13	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 170.35	NO BID	\$ 162.76	\$ 149.49

ITEM DESCRIPTION			T Mina	F W Webb	TI-Sales	Carbyne Construction	Ferguson	Vari-Tech	Blair Supply	Core & Main	
Light Duty Single Terminal Magnetized Tracer Box	25	each	Unit Price	NO BID	\$ 35.78	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 23.50	NO BID	\$ 26.49	\$ 39.00
16" MJ Solid Sleeve	4	each	Unit Price	\$ 600.00	\$ 577.65	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 612.30	NO BID	\$ 603.61	\$ 584.19
12" MJ Solid Sleeve	78	each	Unit Price	\$ 239.00	\$ 229.98	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 243.75	NO BID	\$ 238.00	\$ 232.75
8" MJ Solid Sleeve	2	each	Unit Price	\$ 118.00	\$ 118.15	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 120.90	NO BID	\$ 119.18	\$ 115.49
16" PVC Bell-Spigot Joint Restraint	8	each	Unit Price	NO BID	\$ 164.18	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 371.35	NO BID	\$ 363.92	\$ 356.70
12" PVC Bell-Spigot Joint Restraint	120	each	Unit Price	\$ 131.40	\$ 120.60	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 120.25	NO BID	\$ 103.52	\$ 143.90
8" PVC Bell-Spigot Joint Restraint	4	each	Unit Price	\$ 74.10	\$ 69.63	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 63.00	NO BID	\$ 54.27	\$ 81.05
1" Stainless Steel Tapping Saddle for 12" PVC	30	each	Unit Price	\$ 90.00	\$ 251.15	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 82.10	NO BID	\$ 111.77	\$ 107.50
1" Corporation Stop	35	each	Unit Price	\$ 48.00	\$ 49.00	\$ 58.70	NO BID	\$ 56.90	NO BID	\$ 48.00	\$ 48.92
1" Curb Stop	35	each	Unit Price	\$ 77.00	\$ 98.50	\$ 118.18	NO BID	\$ 127.25	NO BID	\$ 97.00	\$ 95.98
1" Stainless Steel Insert	100	each	Unit Price	\$ 1.50	\$ 1.95	\$ 2.09	NO BID	\$ 2.40	NO BID	\$ 1.70	\$ 1.59
1" PE CTS 200 psi Water Service Tubing - 100 foot coils	4	each	Unit Price	\$ 35.00	\$ 39.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 45.00	\$ 72.00	\$ 41.00	\$ 47.00
Curb Boxes, with 29"/30" 1/2" SS rod, 4.5' to 5.5' bury depth	4	each	Unit Price	\$ 48.00	\$ 82.75	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 149.25	NO BID	\$ 74.00	\$ 69.55
1" CTS Comp x FIP Adapter	4	each	Unit Price	\$ 20.00	\$ 25.35	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 26.35	NO BID	\$ 21.80	\$ 21.60
15" Diameter meter pit with 15" locking lid	2	each	Unit Price	NO BID	\$ 705.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 606.50	NO BID	\$ 710.94	\$ 544.65
16" MJ 22-1/2 Degree Bend	3	each	Unit Price	\$ 641.50	\$ 616.65	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 653.90	NO BID	\$ 630.00	\$ 623.80
16" MJ 45 Degree Bend	3	each	Unit Price	\$ 669.00	\$ 643.18	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 681.85	NO BID	\$ 651.00	\$ 650.55
16" MJ 90 Degree Bend	5	each	Unit Price	\$ 870.00	\$ 837.05	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 886.60	NO BID	\$ 870.00	\$ 845.78
12" x 12" x 12" MJ Tee	8	each	Unit Price	\$ 490.00	\$ 476.10	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 499.85	NO BID	\$ 492.75	\$ 476.88
12" MJ 11-1/4 Degree Bend	3	each	Unit Price	\$ 243.50	\$ 236.16	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 248.30	NO BID	\$ 244.77	\$ 236.94
12" MJ 22-1/2 Degree Bend	6	each	Unit Price	\$ 257.00	\$ 248.85	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 261.95	NO BID	\$ 258.23	\$ 249.96
12" MJ 45 Degree Bend	8	each	Unit Price	\$ 303.00	\$ 295.31	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 308.75	NO BID	\$ 304.37	\$ 294.60
12" MJ 90 Degree Bend	2	each	Unit Price	\$ 381.00	\$ 368.75	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 388.70	NO BID	\$ 383.18	\$ 370.86

ITEM DESCRIPTION			T Mina	F W Webb	TI-Sales	Carbyne Construction	Ferguson	Vari-Tech	Blair Supply	Core & Main	
12" x 8" x 12" MJ Tee	2	each	Unit Price	\$ 372.00	\$ 359.60	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 378.95	NO BID	\$ 373.57	\$ 361.56
12" x 8" MJ Reducer	2	each	Unit Price	\$ 194.50	\$ 189.05	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 198.25	NO BID	\$ 195.43	\$ 189.20
12" MJ Plug	2	each	Unit Price	\$ 136.50	\$ 134.45	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 139.10	NO BID	\$ 137.12	\$ 132.78
12" MJ Cap	2	each	Unit Price	\$ 121.00	\$ 119.10	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 123.50	NO BID	\$ 124.00	\$ 117.90
12" MJ Gland, no accessories	26	each	Unit Price	\$ 21.50	\$ 19.30	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 19.50	\$ 68.78	\$ 19.22	\$ 18.95
12" DIPS DR-11 MJ Adapters w/ stiffeners	26	each	Unit Price	\$ 138.00	\$ 135.65	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 130.00	\$ 141.47	\$ 136.55	\$ 122.45
12" Electrofusion Couplings	12	each	Unit Price	\$ 250.00	\$ 246.89	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 238.75	\$ 239.85	\$ 250.75	\$ 224.85
1" Electrofusion Transition Saddle for 12" DIPS HDPE	1	each	Unit Price	\$ 93.50	\$ 94.15	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 66.55	\$ 131.97	\$ 89.00	\$ 83.00
8" MJ 45 Degree Bend	4	each	Unit Price	\$ 121.00	\$ 119.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 123.50	NO BID	\$ 121.75	\$ 117.90
8" MJ 90 Degree Bend	2	each	Unit Price	\$ 151.00	\$ 148.26	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 154.70	NO BID	\$ 152.50	\$ 147.65
8" x 8" x 8" MJ Tee	1	each	Unit Price	\$ 222.50	\$ 216.41	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 226.85	NO BID	\$ 223.63	\$ 216.48
8" MJ Plug	2	each	Unit Price	\$ 88.50	\$ 86.70	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 90.35	NO BID	\$ 89.07	\$ 86.25
8" MJ Cap	1	each	Unit Price	\$ 65.00	\$ 64.29	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 66.30	NO BID	\$ 65.36	\$ 63.40
12" HDPE DIPS DR11 Blue Stripe Water Main Pipe	1600	feet	Unit Price	\$ 23.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 24.34	\$ 23.68	\$ 24.05	\$ 23.78
18" Hydrant Extension Kit Complete - AVK	6	each	Unit Price	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 552.33	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
24" Hydrant Extension Kit Complete - AVK	6	each	Unit Price	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 621.20	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
36" Hydrant Extension Kit Complete - AVK	2	each	Unit Price	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 973.59	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
6" Hydrant Extension Kit Complete	3	each	Unit Price	NO BID	\$ 332.10	\$ 414.58	NO BID	\$ 519.00	NO BID	\$ 332.64	\$ 449.00
12" Hydrant Extension Kit Complete	3	each	Unit Price	NO BID	\$ 389.15	\$ 488.13	NO BID	\$ 610.00	NO BID	\$ 388.43	\$ 528.00
18" Hydrant Extension Kit Complete	2	each	Unit Price	NO BID	\$ 437.60	\$ 552.33	NO BID	\$ 691.00	NO BID	\$ 440.84	\$ 598.00
24" Hydrant Extension Kit Complete	2	each	Unit Price	NO BID	\$ 476.23	\$ 621.20	NO BID	\$ 777.50	NO BID	\$ 478.88	\$ 673.00
Underground Warning Tape - 1,000 ft Roll	24	each	Unit Price	\$ 46.00	\$ 40.85	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 57.00	NO BID	\$ 43.00	\$ 35.00