

2023 Water Main Materials Bid - Arcadia 15 + Gananda Parkway

Thursday, April 20, 2023 1 p.m.

Bid Tabulation**NOTE: This is ONLY a tabulation and does not imply acceptance of bids.**

ITEM DESCRIPTION				Ferguson Waterworks	TI-SALES	E J Prescott	T Mina Supply East	Core + Main	F W Webb	Blair Supply Corp
16" Rubbers and 6" Fluorocarbon-coated T-Bolts	4	each	Unit Price	\$ 160.95	No Bid	\$ 337.41	\$ 368.00	\$ 214.00	\$ 189.39	\$ 108.00
16" Rubbers and 4" Fluorocarbon-coated T-Bolts	24	each	Unit Price	\$ 106.29	No Bid	\$ 337.41	\$ 116.00	\$ 98.00	\$ 87.35	\$ 85.00
8" Rubbers and 4" Fluorocarbon-coated T-Bolts	35	each	Unit Price	\$ 49.35	No Bid	\$ 94.32	\$ 49.00	\$ 46.00	\$ 42.31	\$ 42.00
8" Rubbers and 6" Fluorocarbon-coated T-Bolts	4	each	Unit Price	\$ 76.85	No Bid	\$ 94.32	\$ 181.00	\$ 104.00	\$ 92.69	\$ 57.00
6" Rubbers and 4-1/2" Fluorocarbon-coated T-Bolts	3	each	Unit Price	\$ 49.20	No Bid	\$ 59.70	\$ 55.00	\$ 53.00	\$ 49.08	\$ 45.00
16" PVC MJ Restraints "Megalug" style	24	each	Unit Price	\$ 288.41	No Bid	\$ 308.74	\$ 235.00	\$ 234.00	\$ 234.35	\$ 245.00
8" PVC MJ Restraints "Megalug" style	35	each	Unit Price	\$ 67.18	No Bid	\$ 71.92	\$ 55.00	\$ 52.00	\$ 58.28	\$ 55.00
Hydrant Unit, from MJ Inlet to Bonnet - 5-1/2 Foot Bury	1	each	Unit Price	\$ 3,764.84	\$ 3,299.30	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 3,640.00	\$ 3,599.00	\$ 3,600.00
8"x 6"x 8" Anchor Tee	1	each	Unit Price	\$ 365.07	No Bid	\$ 390.82	\$ 362.00	\$ 358.00	\$ 356.90	\$ 352.00
6" x 3 ft Anchor pipe	1	each	Unit Price	\$ 473.46	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 960.00	\$ 289.00	\$ 790.75	\$ 380.00
6" MJ x MJ Gate Valve	1	each	Unit Price	\$ 1,038.31	\$ 973.00	\$ 959.90	\$ 973.00	\$ 1,002.00	\$ 970.85	\$ 995.00
8" MJ x MJ Gate Valve	5	each	Unit Price	\$ 1,653.68	\$ 1,532.00	\$ 1,527.43	\$ 1,550.00	\$ 1,597.00	\$ 1,553.00	\$ 1,595.00
16" MJ x MJ Butterfly Valve	1	each	Unit Price	\$ 5,253.97	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 4,848.00	\$ 4,815.00	\$ 5,285.00
2-piece screw type Valve Box with Lid, 38"-60" range	10	each	Unit Price	\$ 230.49	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 265.00	\$ 212.00	\$ 214.00	\$ 220.00
16" MJ Solid Sleeve	4	each	Unit Price	\$ 850.08	No Bid	\$ 910.00	\$ 845.00	\$ 834.00	\$ 818.00	\$ 825.00
8" MJ Solid Sleeve	5	each	Unit Price	\$ 168.49	No Bid	\$ 180.38	\$ 170.00	\$ 165.00	\$ 163.70	\$ 162.00
8" PVC Bell-Spigot Joint Restraint	8	each	Unit Price	\$ 111.32	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 130.00	\$ 92.55	\$ 87.00
16" PVC Bell-Spigot Joint Restraint	8	each	Unit Price	\$ 670.58	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 630.00	\$ 537.80	\$ 435.00
2" Stainless Steel Tapping Saddle for 16" PVC	1	each	Unit Price	\$ 245.20	No Bid	\$ 512.99	\$ 220.00	\$ 217.00	\$ 253.15	\$ 225.00
1" Stainless Steel Tapping Saddle for 16" PVC	2	each	Unit Price	\$ 218.41	No Bid	\$ 512.99	\$ 185.00	\$ 183.00	\$ 245.30	\$ 230.00
1" Stainless Steel Tapping Saddle for 8" PVC	73	each	Unit Price	\$ 170.05	No Bid	\$ 215.34	\$ 146.00	\$ 144.00	\$ 147.00	\$ 170.00

ITEM DESCRIPTION				Ferguson Waterworks	TI-SALES	E J Prescott	T Mina Supply East	Core + Main	F W Webb	Blair Supply Corp
2" Corporation Stop, Ball Style	1	each	Unit Price	\$ 368.17	\$ 252.00	\$ 295.44	\$ 325.00	\$ 285.00	\$ 309.21	\$ 283.00
2" Curb Stop, Ball Style	1	each	Unit Price	\$ 540.72	\$ 358.00	\$ 419.56	\$ 460.00	\$ 404.00	\$ 438.69	\$ 388.00
1" Stainless Steel Insert	150	each	Unit Price	\$ 3.26	\$ 2.59	\$ 2.25	\$ 3.00	\$ 2.00	No Bid	\$ 2.00
2" Stainless Steel Insert	2	each	Unit Price	\$ 11.10	\$ 3.55	\$ 3.09	\$ 4.00	\$ 3.00	No Bid	\$ 2.85
1" PE CTS 200 psi Water Service Tubing - 100 foot coils	8	each	Unit Price	\$ 61.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 60.00	\$ 50.00	\$ 59.00	\$ 52.00
2" PE CTS 200 psi Water Service Tubing - 100 foot coils	1	each	Unit Price	\$ 217.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 210.00	\$ 250.00	\$ 193.00	\$ 175.00
12" MJ x Flg Tapping Valve	2	each	Unit Price	\$ 4,902.66	\$ 4,538.20	\$ 4,527.49	\$ 4,595.00	\$ 4,736.00	\$ 4,647.00	\$ 4,665.00
8" MJ x Flg Tapping Valve	1	each	Unit Price	\$ 2,152.20	\$ 1,994.00	\$ 1,975.58	\$ 2,015.00	\$ 2,079.00	\$ 2,090.00	\$ 2,045.00
12" x 12" Tapping Sleeve SS	2	each	Unit Price	\$ 3,133.93	No Bid	\$ 4,497.66	\$ 2,990.00	\$ 1,878.00	\$ 1,985.00	\$ 1,880.00
12" x 8" Tapping Sleeve SS	1	each	Unit Price	\$ 2,125.54	No Bid	\$ 3,945.23	\$ 1,585.00	\$ 1,131.00	\$ 1,322.00	\$ 1,165.00
24" Electrofusion Coupling	2	each	Unit Price	\$ 1,371.86	No Bid	\$ 1,264.64	\$ 1,100.00	\$ 1,119.00	\$ 2,669.00	\$ 2,500.00
16" MJ 90 Degree Bend	1	each	Unit Price	\$ 1,231.09	No Bid	\$ 1,317.88	\$ 1,220.00	\$ 1,205.00	\$ 1,171.00	\$ 1,200.00
16" MJ 45 Degree Bend	4	each	Unit Price	\$ 946.47	No Bid	\$ 1,013.19	\$ 940.00	\$ 925.00	\$ 905.60	\$ 910.00
16" MJ 22-1/2 Degree Bend	2	each	Unit Price	\$ 907.76	No Bid	\$ 971.75	\$ 900.00	\$ 889.00	\$ 867.00	\$ 885.00
16" MJ 11-1/4 Degree Bend	2	each	Unit Price	\$ 907.76	No Bid	\$ 971.75	\$ 900.00	\$ 888.00	\$ 867.00	\$ 885.00
16" HDPE DIPS DR11 90 Degree Bend	1	each	Unit Price	\$ 695.88	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 635.00	\$ 334.00	\$ 444.00	\$ 1,140.00
16" HDPE DIPS DR11 45 Degree Bend	4	each	Unit Price	\$ 404.45	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 440.00	\$ 211.00	\$ 297.00	\$ 740.00
16" HDPE DIPS DR11 22-1/2 Degree Bend	2	each	Unit Price	\$ 368.24	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 330.00	\$ 286.00	\$ 258.00	\$ 695.00
16" HDPE DIPS DR11 11-1/4 Degree Bend	2	each	Unit Price	\$ 409.15	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 330.00	\$ 286.00	\$ 403.00	\$ 698.00
16" MJ Cap	1	each	Unit Price	\$ 473.61	No Bid	\$ 507.00	\$ 470.00	\$ 463.00	\$ 450.20	\$ 460.00
16" MJ Gland, no accessories	4	each	Unit Price	\$ 46.29	No Bid	\$ 50.89	No Bid	\$ 46.00	\$ 46.53	\$ 46.00
16" DIPS DR-11 MJ Adapters w/ stiffeners	4	each	Unit Price	\$ 338.22	No Bid	\$ 1,587.60	\$ 920.00	\$ 470.00	\$ 341.20	\$ 525.00

ITEM DESCRIPTION				Ferguson Waterworks	TI-SALES	E J Prescott	T Mina Supply East	Core + Main	F W Webb	Blair Supply Corp	
16" Electrofusion Coupling	2	each	Unit Price	\$ 683.76	No Bid	\$ 506.47	\$ 555.00	\$ 437.00	\$ 458.80	\$ 550.00	
8" MJ 45 Degree Bend	5	each	Unit Price	\$ 171.53	No Bid	\$ 183.51	\$ 170.00	\$ 168.00	\$ 166.45	\$ 166.00	
8" MJ 22-1/2 Degree Bend	3	each	Unit Price	\$ 168.49	No Bid	\$ 180.38	\$ 170.00	\$ 165.00	\$ 163.70	\$ 164.00	
8" MJ 11-1/4 Degree Bend	2	each	Unit Price	\$ 153.31	No Bid	\$ 164.13	\$ 150.00	\$ 150.00	\$ 147.45	\$ 149.00	
8" MJ Gland, no accessories	4	each	Unit Price	\$ 16.69	No Bid	\$ 17.88	\$ 25.00	\$ 17.00	\$ 17.15	\$ 19.00	
8" DIPS DR-11 MJ Adapters w/ stiffeners	30	each	Unit Price	\$ 87.41	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 92.00	\$ 137.00	\$ 90.33	\$ 99.00	
8" Electrofusion Coupling	15	each	Unit Price	\$ 90.90	No Bid	\$ 98.19	\$ 91.00	\$ 81.00	\$ 86.31	\$ 98.00	
8" x 8" x 8" MJ x Swivel Tee	2	each	Unit Price	\$ 438.70	No Bid	\$ 469.63	\$ 435.00	\$ 430.00	\$ 419.20	\$ 424.00	
8" MJ Plug	1	each	Unit Price	\$ 125.99	No Bid	\$ 134.88	\$ 125.00	\$ 123.00	\$ 121.15	\$ 123.00	
12" x 8" MJ Reducer	2	each	Unit Price	\$ 305.11	No Bid	\$ 326.63	\$ 300.00	\$ 299.00	\$ 297.40	\$ 296.00	
16" DR18 PVC Water Main Pipe	400	feet	Unit Price	\$ 77.08	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 72.35	\$ 72.88	\$ 78.55	\$ 90.56	
8" DR18 PVC Water Main Pipe	600	feet	Unit Price	\$ 22.96	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 20.85	\$ 21.41	\$ 20.97	\$ 23.34	
HDPE Flex Restraint	32	each	Unit Price	\$ 55.48	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 32.00	\$ 34.85	\$ 54.00	
Snake Pit Tracer Boxes	17	each	Unit Price	\$ 27.12	No Bid	\$ 29.86	No Bid	\$ 39.00	No Bid	\$ 38.00	
10-GA high strength blue tracer wire - 500 ft roll	6	each	Unit Price	\$ 163.18	No Bid	\$ 132.88	No Bid	\$ 125.00	No Bid	\$ 120.00	
Underground Warning Tape - 1,000 ft Roll	70	each	Unit Price	\$ 80.78	No Bid	\$ 76.59	\$ 65.00	\$ 39.00	No Bid	\$ 72.00	
The following HDPE pipe is being bid as a GROUP; the intention is to purchase all HDPE Pipe from ONE VENDOR											
24" HDPE DIPS DR11 Blue Stripe Water Main Pipe (40 ft)	per ft	160	feet	Unit Price	\$ 114.32	No Bid	\$ 117.53	\$ 115.00	\$ 116.00	\$ 114.05	\$ 120.00
16" HDPE DIPS DR11 Blue Stripe Water Main Pipe (40 ft)	per ft	160	feet	Unit Price	\$ 51.04	No Bid	\$ 52.47	\$ 52.00	\$ 52.00	\$ 51.24	\$ 54.00
8" HDPE DIPS DR11 Blue Stripe Water Main Pipe (40 ft)	per ft	1,520	feet	Unit Price	\$ 13.33	No Bid	\$ 14.20	\$ 14.00	\$ 13.50	\$ 13.84	\$ 14.50