Wayne County Water & Sewer Authority

Commonly Used Materials - Bid opening Friday, August 19, 2022 at 11 a.m.

Awarded on the basis of total of unit prices in each category

VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR
EJ Prescott -
No Submittals,
Bid
Categories Ti-SALES disqualified HY-VIZ Blair Supply T Mina F W Webb Core + Main Ferguson
Total Tapping Saddles 1,061.55 - NO BID 897.19 873.00 883.88 904.78 822.00
Total Multi Range Tapping Saddles NO BID - NO BID NO BID 725.00 830.20 712.59 827.50
Total Curb Boxes and Parts NO BID - NO BID 138.30 125.00 113.81 101.00 107.00
Total Water Service Tubing Copper Tube Size (CTS) NO BID - NO BID 3.77 3.98 NO BID 4.09 4.39
Total Water Main Repair Bands NO BID - NO BID 5,721.15 7,230.00 8,312.49 5,305.03 7,845.50
Total Water Main Repair Couplings 4,240.27 - NO BID 3,749.00 3,485.00 3,604.73 3,770.45 3,852.35
Total Valve Boxes and Parts NO BID - NO BID 932.50 1,015.00 1,006.29 1,037.04 1,009.00
Total Hydrants 12,016.32 - NO BID 13,255.00 | NO BID 13,946.20 13,069.84 14,875.00
Total Fiberglass Hydrant Markers NO BID - 81.97 | NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Total Meter Setting Brass NO BID - NO BID NO BID 926.00 1,425.79 1,272.83 | NO BID
Total Water Service Brass 1,826.36 - NO BID 1,502.68 1,681.00 1,674.67 1,434.09 | NO BID
Total C-509 Valves 4,888.91 - NO BID 5,093.00 6,600.00 5,059.80 4,983.54 5,390.00
Total C-515 Valves 4,888.91 - NO BID 5,093.00 | NO BID 5,059.80 4,983.54 5,390.00
Total Sewer Parts NO BID - NO BID 1,554.88 1,196.00 1,462.63 1,225.36 1,475.95
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