

Wayne County Water & Sewer Authority

<b>Commonly Used Materials - Bid opening Thursday, January 19, 2023 at 11 a.m.</b>								
<b>Awarded on the basis of total of unit prices in each category</b>								
	VENDOR	VENDOR	VENDOR	VENDOR	VENDOR	VENDOR	VENDOR	VENDOR
<b>Categories</b>	<b>T Mina Supply East</b>	<b>Ti Sales</b>	<b>HY-VIZ</b>	<b>Ferguson Waterworks</b>	<b>EJ Prescott</b>	<b>F W Webb</b>	<b>Core &amp; Main</b>	<b>Blair Supply</b>
<b>Total Tapping Saddles</b>	751.00	1,083.92	NO BID	815.60	NO BID	851.01	1,121.00	896.00
<b>Total Multi Range Tapping Saddles</b>	720.00	NO BID	NO BID	829.96	NO BID	778.10	799.00	NO BID
<b>Total Curb Boxes and Parts</b>	115.00	NO BID	NO BID	85.62	120.18	111.83	93.50	154.00
<b>Total Water Service Tubing Copper Tube Size (CTS)</b>	3.95	NO BID	NO BID	3.16	NO BID	3.82	6.50	3.63
<b>Total Water Main Repair Bands</b>	7,020.00	NO BID	NO BID	7,004.07	NO BID	7,289.05	4,905.85	5,488.00
<b>Total Water Main Repair Couplings</b>	3,415.00	3,909.30	NO BID	3,517.43	4,187.04	3,849.45	3,730.60	3,746.00
<b>Total Valve Boxes and Parts</b>	1,025.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	857.67	793.19	930.50
<b>Total Hydrants</b>	NO BID	12,294.71	NO BID	15,608.47	NO BID	14,602.00	14,997.25	14,489.00
<b>Total Fiberglass Hydrant Markers</b>	NO BID	NO BID	87.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
<b>Total Meter Setting Brass</b>	963.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	1,000.98	874.84	938.06	1,266.50
<b>Total Water Service Brass</b>	1,686.00	1,901.98	NO BID	NO BID	1,842.05	1,677.64	1,575.83	1,695.30
<b>Total C-509 Valves</b>	5,560.00	4,901.98	NO BID	5,990.89	NO BID	5,570.09	5,815.00	5,755.00
<b>Total C-515 Valves</b>	NO BID	4,901.98	NO BID	5,990.89	5,683.96	5,570.09	5,815.00	5,755.00
<b>Total Sewer Parts</b>	1,234.00	NO BID	NO BID	1,145.04	NO BID	1,168.38	1,013.78	1,436.60
<b>THIS IS ONLY A TABULATION AND DOES NOT IMPLY ACCEPTANCE OF BIDS</b>								