

**Huron Water District #9 Water Main Materials**  
**Wednesday, February 21, 2024 1:30 p.m.**  
**Bid Tabulation**

ITEM DESCRIPTION			Ti-Sales, Inc.	E J Prescott	Ferguson	Vari-Tech	T Mina	F W Webb	Core + Main	Blair Supply	
8" Rubbers and 4" Fluorocarbon-coated T-Bolts	456	each	Unit Price	No Bid	\$ 64.99	\$ 44.73	No Bid	\$ 43.00	\$ 38.08	\$ 39.00	\$ 47.00
8" Rubbers and 6" Fluorocarbon-coated T-Bolts	24	each	Unit Price	No Bid	\$ 164.99	\$ 49.36	No Bid	\$ 73.00	\$ 54.00	\$ 55.00	\$ 63.00
6" Rubbers and 4-1/2" Fluorocarbon-coated T-Bolts	240	each	Unit Price	No Bid	\$ 82.42	\$ 45.18	No Bid	\$ 48.00	\$ 46.42	\$ 43.00	\$ 51.00
6" Rubbers and 4" Fluorocarbon-coated T-Bolts	8	each	Unit Price	No Bid	\$ 77.75	\$ 43.87	No Bid	\$ 42.00	\$ 36.54	\$ 41.00	\$ 45.00
4" Rubbers and 4" Fluorocarbon-coated T-Bolts	8	each	Unit Price	No Bid	\$ 57.49	\$ 43.02	No Bid	\$ 31.00	\$ 27.15	\$ 27.00	\$ 43.00
8" PVC MJ Restraints "Megalug" style	370	each	Unit Price	No Bid	\$ 66.62	\$ 49.27	No Bid	\$ 54.00	\$ 52.83	\$ 48.49	\$ 53.00
6" PVC MJ Restraints "Megalug" style	5	each	Unit Price	No Bid	\$ 45.01	\$ 33.29	No Bid	\$ 39.00	\$ 35.71	\$ 32.80	\$ 45.00
8" DI Mechanical Restraints "Megalug" style	25	each	Unit Price	No Bid	\$ 54.34	\$ 40.18	No Bid	\$ 43.00	\$ 43.11	\$ 39.60	\$ 38.00
6" DI Mechanical Restraints "Megalug" style	5	each	Unit Price	No Bid	\$ 35.60	\$ 26.34	No Bid	\$ 28.00	\$ 48.26	\$ 25.95	\$ 28.00
Hydrant Unit, from MJ Inlet to Bonnet - 5 Foot Bury	66	each	Unit Price	\$ 3,146.61	No Bid	\$ 3,614.12	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 3,570.00	\$ 3,499.00	\$ 3,573.00
Hydrant Unit, from MJ Inlet to Bonnet - 5 -1/2 Foot Bury	8	each	Unit Price	\$ 3,216.43	No Bid	\$ 3,694.25	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 3,652.40	\$ 3,582.00	\$ 3,650.00
Hydrant Unit, from MJ Inlet to Bonnet - 6 Foot Bury	4	each	Unit Price	\$ 3,268.77	No Bid	\$ 3,774.53	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 3,732.00	\$ 3,659.00	\$ 3,730.00
Hydrant Unit, from MJ Inlet to Bonnet - 6 -1/2 Foot Bury	2	each	Unit Price	\$ 3,338.21	No Bid	\$ 3,854.81	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 3,811.00	\$ 3,737.00	\$ 3,810.00
Hydrant Unit, from MJ Inlet to Bonnet - 7 Foot Bury	2	each	Unit Price	\$ 3,407.66	No Bid	\$ 3,934.65	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 3,890.00	\$ 3,815.00	\$ 3,890.00
Hydrant Unit, from MJ Inlet to Bonnet - 8 Foot Bury	2	each	Unit Price	\$ 3,546.55	No Bid	\$ 4,095.22	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 4,049.00	\$ 3,970.00	\$ 4,050.00
8"x 6"x 8" Anchor Tee	80	each	Unit Price	No Bid	\$ 382.73	\$ 372.30	No Bid	\$ 385.00	\$ 362.10	\$ 361.30	\$ 371.00
6" x 4 ft Anchor pipe	3	each	Unit Price	\$ 469.93	No Bid	\$ 374.15	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 524.00	\$ 369.00	\$ 430.00
6" x 3 ft Anchor pipe	50	each	Unit Price	\$ 409.27	\$ 806.99	\$ 325.85	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 452.40	\$ 321.00	\$ 365.00
6" x 2 ft Anchor pipe	2	each	Unit Price	\$ 335.07	\$ 549.16	\$ 260.08	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 249.10	\$ 263.00	\$ 255.00
6" x 1.5 ft Anchor pipe	2	each	Unit Price	\$ 304.27	\$ 474.38	\$ 242.25	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 211.00	\$ 240.00	\$ 216.00
6" x 1 ft Anchor pipe	2	each	Unit Price	\$ 274.40	\$ 381.68	\$ 218.47	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 170.30	\$ 212.00	\$ 174.00
6" MJ x MJ Gate Valve	88	each	Unit Price	\$ 935.38	\$ 999.00	\$ 1,018.85	No Bid	\$ 1,005.00	\$ 1,015.30	\$ 987.00	\$ 1,020.00
8" MJ x MJ Gate Valve	50	each	Unit Price	\$ 1,488.47	\$ 1,585.00	\$ 1,622.68	No Bid	\$ 1,605.00	\$ 1,603.20	\$ 1,572.00	\$ 1,625.00
4" MJ x MJ Gate Valve	1	each	Unit Price	\$ 728.76	\$ 815.00	\$ 798.77	No Bid	\$ 790.00	\$ 793.25	\$ 774.00	\$ 800.00
4" Foster Adapter w/ Fluorocarbon-coated accessories	1	each	Unit Price	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 119.94	No Bid	\$ 110.00	\$ 104.48	\$ 101.00	\$ 120.00
5-1/4" 2-piece screw type Valve Box with Lid, 38"-60" range	150	each	Unit Price	No Bid	\$ 231.18	\$ 228.02	No Bid	\$ 253.00	\$ 207.10	\$ 207.00	\$ 221.00
5-1/4" x 10" Screw Type Valve box top section	12	each	Unit Price	No Bid	\$ 45.40	\$ 46.87	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 48.95	\$ 47.60	\$ 46.00
5-1/4" x 12" Screw Type Valve box top section	12	each	Unit Price	No Bid	\$ 66.74	\$ 68.03	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 104.20	No Bid	\$ 68.00
5-1/4" x 24" Screw Type Valve box bottom section	12	each	Unit Price	No Bid	\$ 106.57	\$ 74.81	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 113.70	\$ 77.60	\$ 73.00
8" HDPE DIPS DR-11 MJ Adapter with stiffener	46	each	Unit Price	No Bid	\$ 87.60	\$ 85.51	\$ 178.12	\$ 90.00	\$ 82.76	\$ 81.25	\$ 90.00
8" MJ Gland, no accessories	42	each	Unit Price	No Bid	\$ 17.14	\$ 17.03	No Bid	\$ 20.00	\$ 18.28	\$ 17.95	\$ 18.00

ITEM DESCRIPTION			Ti-Sales, Inc.	E J Prescott	Ferguson	Vari-Tech	T Mina	F W Webb	Core + Main	Blair Supply	
8" MJ Solid Sleeve	15	each	Unit Price	No Bid	\$ 172.93	\$ 171.83	No Bid	\$ 170.00	\$ 167.45	\$ 166.75	\$ 170.00
8" PVC Bell-Spigot Joint Restraint	12	feet	Unit Price	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 109.12	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 110.05	\$ 119.95	\$ 84.00
8" HDPE DIPS DR-11 Electrofusion Coupling	22	each	Unit Price	No Bid	\$ 86.59	\$ 84.52	\$ 100.74	\$ 90.00	\$ 81.79	\$ 80.25	\$ 88.00
1" Stainless Steel Tapping Saddle for 8" PVC	75	each	Unit Price	No Bid	\$ 223.11	\$ 118.15	No Bid	\$ 120.00	\$ 156.80	\$ 105.75	\$ 108.00
1" Stainless Steel Tapping Saddle for 6" PVC	1	each	Unit Price	No Bid	\$ 199.87	\$ 114.89	No Bid	\$ 120.00	\$ 149.80	\$ 101.75	\$ 106.00
1" Corporation Stop	50	each	Unit Price	No Bid	\$ 78.00	\$ 73.64	No Bid	\$ 84.00	\$ 59.15	\$ 57.95	\$ 60.00
1" Curb Stop	50	each	Unit Price	No Bid	\$ 120.00	\$ 149.67	No Bid	\$ 131.00	\$ 118.89	\$ 116.65	\$ 120.00
1" Stainless Steel Insert	200	each	Unit Price	No Bid	\$ 2.30	\$ 3.07	No Bid	\$ 3.00	No Bid	\$ 1.95	\$ 2.35
1" PE CTS 200 psi Water Service Tubing -100 foot coils	800	foot	Unit Price	No Bid	\$ 0.55	\$ 0.63	No Bid	\$ 0.56	\$ 0.58	\$ 0.57	\$ 0.56
8" x 8" x 8" x 8" MJ Cross	1	each	Unit Price	No Bid	\$ 479.83	\$ 476.79	No Bid	\$ 490.00	\$ 464.30	\$ 462.75	\$ 477.00
8" x 8" x 8" MJ Swivel Tee	6	each	Unit Price	No Bid	\$ 450.23	\$ 447.38	No Bid	\$ 460.00	\$ 435.90	\$ 434.20	\$ 445.00
8" MJ x MJ 11-1/4 Degree Bend	3	each	Unit Price	No Bid	\$ 157.35	\$ 156.35	No Bid	\$ 160.00	\$ 152.20	\$ 151.70	\$ 156.00
8" MJ x PE 11-1/4 Degree Bend	8	each	Unit Price	No Bid	\$ 194.00	\$ 190.41	No Bid	\$ 195.00	\$ 185.30	\$ 184.75	\$ 190.00
8" MJ x MJ 22 1/2 Degree Bend	4	each	Unit Price	No Bid	\$ 174.00	\$ 171.83	No Bid	\$ 175.00	\$ 167.45	\$ 166.75	\$ 171.00
8" MJ x PE 22 1/2 Degree Bend	8	each	Unit Price	No Bid	\$ 240.00	\$ 236.85	No Bid	\$ 240.00	\$ 230.70	\$ 229.85	\$ 236.00
8" MJ x MJ 45 Degree Bend	18	each	Unit Price	No Bid	\$ 178.00	\$ 174.93	No Bid	\$ 180.00	\$ 169.90	\$ 169.75	\$ 174.00
8" MJ x PE 45 Degree Bend	8	each	Unit Price	No Bid	\$ 180.00	\$ 178.80	No Bid	\$ 185.00	\$ 174.30	\$ 173.50	\$ 179.00
8" MJ Plug	2	each	Unit Price	No Bid	\$ 130.00	\$ 128.49	No Bid	\$ 130.00	\$ 125.05	\$ 124.70	\$ 128.00
8" x 4" MJ Tee	1	each	Unit Price	No Bid	\$ 260.00	\$ 256.97	No Bid	\$ 260.00	\$ 249.94	\$ 249.40	\$ 257.00
8" x 6" PE x PE Reducer	1	each	Unit Price	No Bid	\$ 135.00	\$ 132.36	No Bid	\$ 135.00	\$ 139.00	\$ 128.45	\$ 132.00
6" 2-piece MJ Repair Gland	12	each	Unit Price	No Bid	\$ 26.00	\$ 27.91	No Bid	\$ 25.00	\$ 28.15	\$ 51.05	\$ 28.00
8" 2-piece MJ Repair Gland	12	each	Unit Price	No Bid	\$ 37.00	\$ 39.75	No Bid	\$ 25.00	\$ 29.68	\$ 80.35	\$ 38.00
4" MJ Plug	1	each	Unit Price	No Bid	\$ 60.00	\$ 58.05	No Bid	\$ 60.00	\$ 59.30	\$ 56.30	\$ 60.00
12" x 8" SS Tapping Sleeve for C-900 PVC	2	each	Unit Price	No Bid	\$ 3,953.17	\$ 1,813.26	No Bid	\$ 2,070.00	\$ 1,353.00	\$ 1,044.50	\$ 1,100.00
8" x 8" SS Tapping Sleeve for C-900 PVC	1	each	Unit Price	No Bid	\$ 3,240.46	\$ 1,614.30	No Bid	\$ 1,995.00	\$ 1,069.50	\$ 974.75	\$ 1,000.00
8" MJ x Flange Tapping Valve	3	each	Unit Price	No Bid	\$ 2,113.87	\$ 2,224.21	No Bid	\$ 2,100.00	\$ 2,115.00	\$ 2,047.00	\$ 2,115.00
8" HDPE DIPS DR11 Blue Stripe Water Main Pipe (40 ft)	3,080	foot	Unit Price	No Bid	\$ 11.13	\$ 10.68	\$ 12.89	\$ 10.75	\$ 10.38	\$ 10.65	\$ 10.68
Underground Warning Tape - 1,000 ft Roll	30	each	Unit Price	No Bid	\$ 77.50	\$ 55.37	\$ 72.54	\$ 80.00	\$ 84.99	\$ 38.00	\$ 80.00
10GA EHS CCS Tracer Wire (Blue) - 500 ft Roll	8	each	Unit Price	No Bid	\$ 188.29	\$ 111.50	\$ 110.00	\$ 70.00	\$ 76.90	\$ 107.00	\$ 356.00
Silt Fence Roll - 36" x 96 ft NYSDOT (1.875" x 1.875" x 42" post - 6 ft center): changed to per foot price after bids	4,650	foot	Unit Price	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 1.69	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid